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Bid Item # 1 2 3 4 5 6 7 8 9 10 11 12 13

ITB # SPC 05-15-16

Promotional and 

Marketing Items

Lanyard Flash Drive
Portable 

Charger

Car 

Charger

Wall 

Charger
Sunglasses

Spiral 

notebook 

4.5" x 6.25" 

Portfolio 6" 

x 8.75" w/ 

notepad

Lrg 

Microfiber 

Portfoli (10 

3/8" x 13 

1/2")

Silicone 

Card 

Sleeve

Orbit 

Tumbler (24 

oz)

Coffee 

Tumbler 

(15 oz)

Water 

Bottle 

(20 oz)

Estimated Annual Qty        10,000             5,000           250           600       3,000              1,500            5,000                250                  250        1,000            3,000             250     3,000 

AGAS Mfg. $0.47

AMC Promotional Prod. $0.32 $2.12 $0.92 $0.68 $0.81 $1.74 $2.98 $8.15 $0.51 $2.19 $4.58 $1.32

Authentic Promotions $0.99 $1.89 $1.57 $1.27 $1.59 $2.59 $6.99 $0.69 $2.99 $4.39 $1.39

Helinger Advertising $1.13 $2.99 $6.81 $1.30 $1.72 $1.66 $1.75 $3.15 $8.00 $0.90 $3.81 $5.50 $1.50

Levy Marketing $0.38 $3.15 $6.97 $1.28 $2.37 $1.64 $1.79 $3.11 $8.66 $0.81 $3.87 $5.03 $1.61

LivJaxDan $0.93 $4.38 $7.67 $1.30 $1.85 $1.75 $2.32 $3.15 $9.10 $0.92 $4.92 $3.27 $1.34

Promoversity $1.99 $2.61 $7.33 $2.19 $2.12 $1.56 $1.63 $2.82 $6.27 $0.85 $4.33 $4.43 $1.42

Reliable Promotions $0.58 $2.25 $6.89 $1.90 $1.83 $1.25 $1.60 $3.25 $7.90 $0.36 $3.00 $5.65 $1.29

Ledgend

Awarded Item

No Bid Provided

Required Sample Not 

Provided

Price tie on button: 

Award to FL business
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Bid Item #

ITB # SPC 05-15-16

Promotional and 

Marketing Items

Estimated Annual Qty

AGAS Mfg.

AMC Promotional Prod.

Authentic Promotions

Helinger Advertising

Levy Marketing

LivJaxDan

Promoversity

Reliable Promotions

Ledgend

Awarded Item

No Bid Provided

Required Sample Not 

Provided

Price tie on button: 

Award to FL business

14 15 16 17 18 19 20 21 22 23 24 25 26 27

Koozie
Drawstring 

Backpack

Lunch Bag

approx 

9" x 7" x 14"

Mesh back 

hat

Cotton 

Twill Cap

Stress 

Ball
Pennant

Lapel 

Pin

Button  

(2  1/4")

Pen - 

Blue 

Pen w/ 

Stylus

BIC 

Pencils

Oval Sticker 

(4" x 3")

Car 

Window 

Sticker 

(20" x 2")

   10,000           10,000                 3,000             200           100    1,000        3,000    2,000      2,000    30,000          1,000      1,500              3,000       20,000 

$0.30 $0.78 $2.10 $3.25 $3.25 $0.85 $0.72 $0.75 $0.27 $0.22 $0.60 $0.19 $0.17 $0.22

$0.42 $0.65 $2.01 $3.57 $9.06 $0.73 $0.73 $0.43 $0.19 $0.63 $0.64 $0.18 $0.16 $0.18

$0.59 $0.97 $1.99 $3.29 $6.99 $0.69 $2.29 $0.69 $0.19 $0.33 $0.39 $0.16 $0.39 $0.25

$0.89 $1.13 $2.24 $3.75 $9.65 $0.90 $1.24 $0.83 $0.26 $0.29 $0.45 $0.23 $0.21 $0.19

$0.71 $1.28 $2.60 $3.95 $10.36 $0.86 $1.25 $1.24 $0.37 $0.32 $0.42 $0.18 $0.32 $0.45

$0.78 $0.99 $2.54 $4.18 $4.41 $0.92 $1.29 $0.97 $0.37 $0.53 $0.45 $0.26 $0.26 $0.31

$0.49 $1.06 $2.27 $3.49 $9.49 $0.85 $1.26 $0.83 $0.29 $0.33 $0.55 $0.30 $0.22 $0.25

$0.76 $0.59 $2.29 $4.62 $8.00 $0.88 $1.00 $0.83 $0.24 $0.28 $0.72 $0.26 $0.18 $0.16
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Bid Item #

ITB # SPC 05-15-16

Promotional and 

Marketing Items

Estimated Annual Qty

AGAS Mfg.

AMC Promotional Prod.

Authentic Promotions

Helinger Advertising

Levy Marketing

LivJaxDan

Promoversity

Reliable Promotions

Ledgend

Awarded Item

No Bid Provided

Required Sample Not 

Provided

Price tie on button: 

Award to FL business

28 29 30 31 32 33

Table 

Throw 

Blue T-

Shirts 

(Sm - XL)

Blue T-Shirts 

(2XL - 6XL)

White T-

Shirts 

(Sm - XL)

White T-Shirts 

(2XL - 6XL)

Blue T-

Shirts 

(XS)

Women’s 

Polo 

(XS - XL)

Women’s Polo 

(2XL - 4XL)

Women’s Polo 

(5XL - 6XL)

Men’s Polo 

(XS - XL)

Men’s Polo 

(2XL - 4XL)

Men’s Polo 

(5XL - 6XL)

              20        3,000         1,500          250          1,000                    250                         20           1,000                  250                   20 

$49.00

$179 (6')

$186 (8')

$135.00 $2.89 $5.99 $2.59 $4.45 $5.25

$130.00 $5.12

$6.69 (2XL)

$8.08 (3XL-6XL)

Per Unit Avg: 

$7.39

$4.00

$5.76 (2XL)

$6.97 (3XL-6XL)

Per Unit Avg: 

$6.37

$3.67 $13.27

$14.27 (2XL)

$16.27 (3XL)

$17.27 (4XL)

Per Unit Avg: 

$15.94

$19.27 (5XL

$20.27 (6XL)

Per unit Avg: 

$19.77

$13.27

$14.27 (2XL)

$16.27 (3XL)

$17.27 (4XL)

Per Unit Avg: 

$15.94

$19.27 (5XL

$20.27 (6XL)

Per unit Avg: 

$19.77

$108.94

$110.00 $3.95

$6.25 (2XL)

$7.85 (3XL-6XL)

Per Unit Avg: 

$7.05

$3.50

$5.50 (2XL)

$6.75 (3XL-6XL)

Per Unit Avg: 

$6.13

$3.95 $11.99

$12.99 (2XL)

$14.99 (3XL)

$15.99 (4XL)

Per Unit Avg: 

$14.66

$18.95 $11.99

$12.99 (2XL)

$14.99 (3XL)

$15.99 (4XL)

Per Unit Avg: 

$14.66

$18.95

$85.56 $2.55 $4.55 $2.38 $4.38 $2.47 $14.19 $16.19 $16.19 $14.19 $16.19 $16.19

$120.00

34 35
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Bid Item #

ITB # SPC 05-15-16

Promotional and 

Marketing Items

Estimated Annual Qty

AGAS Mfg.

AMC Promotional Prod.

Authentic Promotions

Helinger Advertising

Levy Marketing

LivJaxDan

Promoversity

Reliable Promotions

Ledgend

Awarded Item

No Bid Provided

Required Sample Not 

Provided

Price tie on button: 

Award to FL business

Men's Oxford 

Longsleeve / 

Blue

 (S-XL)

Men's Oxford 

Longsleeve / 

Blue

 (2XL - 6XL)

Men's Oxford 

Longsleeve / 

White

 (S-XL)

Men's Oxford 

Longsleeve / 

White

 (2XL - 6XL)

Women's 

Oxford 

Longsleeve / 

Blue

 (S-XL)

Women's 

Oxford 

Longsleeve / 

Blue

 (2XL - 6XL)

Women's 

Oxford 

Longsleeve / 

White

 (S-XL)

Women's Oxford 

Longsleeve / 

White

 (2XL - 6XL)

                      500                      250                      250                      100              1,000                         60                 250                           30 

$17.00

$18.00 (2XL)

$20.00 (3XL)

$21.00 (4XL)

$23.00 (5XL)

$24.00 (6XL)

Per unit Avg: 

$21.20

$17.00

$18.00 (2XL)

$20.00 (3XL)

$21.00 (4XL)

$23.00 (5XL)

$24.00 (6XL)

Per unit Avg: 

$21.20

$17.00

$18.00 (2XL)

$20.00 (3XL)

$21.00 (4XL)

$23.00 (5XL)

$24.00 (6XL)

Per unit Avg: 

$21.20

$17.00

$18.00 (2XL)

$20.00 (3XL)

$21.00 (4XL)

$23.00 (5XL)

$24.00 (6XL)

Per unit Avg: 

$21.20

$16.95

$18.95 (2XL)

$19.95 (3XL)

$21.95 (4XL)

$21.95 (5XL)

$22.95 (6XL)

Per unit Avg: 

$21.15

$16.95

$18.95 (2XL)

$19.95 (3XL)

$21.95 (4XL)

$21.95 (5XL)

$22.95 (6XL)

Per unit Avg: 

$21.15

$16.95

$18.95 (2XL)

$19.95 (3XL)

No bid 4XL-6XL

$16.95

$18.95 (2XL)

$19.95 (3XL)

No bid 4XL-6XL

$18.56 $20.56 $18.56 $20.56 $18.56 $20.56 $18.56 $20.56

$13.39

$14.64 (2XL)

$16.64 (3XL)

$17.64 (4XL)

$19.64 (5XL)

$20.64 (6XL)

Per unit Avg: 

$17.84

$13.39

$14.64 (2XL)

$16.64 (3XL)

$17.64 (4XL)

$19.64 (5XL)

$20.64 (6XL)

Per unit Avg: 

$17.84

$13.39

$14.64 (2XL)

$16.64 (3XL)

$17.64 (4XL)

$19.64 (5XL)

$20.64 (6XL)

Per unit Avg: 

$17.84

$13.39

$14.64 (2XL)

$16.64 (3XL)

$17.64 (4XL)

$19.64 (5XL)

$20.64 (6XL)

Per unit Avg: 

$17.84

38 3936 37


